
REGULAR MEETING 

COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY 

 MARCH 7, 2017 – 5:00 P.M. 

 

 

  The Council met in regular session on Tuesday, March 7, 2017, at 5:00 p.m., in the 

Council Auditorium, City Hall, with the following members present: 

 

PRESENT: BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN,  

 BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8  

ABSENT:       BURKETTE  --1 

   

President Charles Jinright presided as Chairman of the meeting, and Brenda Gale 

Blalock, City Clerk, served as the Clerk of the meeting.  The meeting was opened with the 

invocation by Brenda Gale Blalock, City Clerk, and the Pledge of Allegiance.   

 

Councillor Bollinger made a motion to adopt the February 21, 2017, Work Session 

Minutes, as circulated, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN,  

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 Councillor Green made a motion to adopt the February 21, 2017, Regular Council 

Minutes, as circulated, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN,  

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place for the public hearing on proposed 

Ordinance amending Code of Ordinances of the City of Montgomery, Chapter 5, Article 

IV/Electrical; Code, Section 5-123 Permit Inspections fees.  No one was present representing 

this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item.  The Chairman declared that the 

public hearing was closed. 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed ordinance: 

ORDINANCE NO. 21-2017 

 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, 

ALABAMA, that Code of Ordinances of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, Article IV, 

Electrical Code, Sec. 5-123 be and is hereby amended to read as follows: 

“Sec. 5-123. - Permit inspection fees. 

(a)  Base Permit Fee .....$25.00 

  

(b)  Commercial meter loops. 

  

Up to 100 amps ..... $6.00 
 200 amps ..... 8.00 
 400 amps ..... 10.00 
 600 amps ..... 15.00 
 800 amps ..... 20.00 
 1,200 amps ..... 25.00 
 1,600 amps ..... 30.00 



 2,000 amps ..... 45.00 

  

(c)  Residential meter loops new buildings. Includes outlet fees for receptacles, lights, switches, smoke 

detectors and light fixtures.  

Up to 100 amps ..... $20.00 
 200 amps ..... 25.00 
 400 amps ..... 30.00 

Over 400 amps ..... 35.00 

  

(d)  Residential service upgrades existing buildings. Includes fees for outlets, fixtures, and appliances.  

First meter loop .....$15.00  

Each additional meter loop .....5.00  

If service is not changed, all applicable fees shall apply.  

(e)  Wiring to outlets. Receptacles, lights, switches, smoke detectors.  

One to ten outlets .....$3.00  

11 outlets and above, per .....0.30  

(f)  Fixtures.  

One to ten fixtures .....$3.00  

11 fixtures and above, per .....0.30  

(g)  Appliances.  

Ranges, cooktops, ovens, per .....$2.50  

Clothes dryers .....2.50  

Water heaters .....2.50  

Welder outlets .....2.50  

Similar appliances not listed .....2.50  

Air conditioning units not over six hp, per unit (use motor schedule for units over six hp) .....3.00  

Electric heating units, up to 20 kw, per unit (use kw rated equipment schedule for over 20 kw) 

.....3.00  

Dishwashers .....1.50  

Garbage disposals .....1.50  

Bath heaters .....1.50  

Fractional HP motor appliances, per (including hood vent fan exhaust fans, attic fans, furnace 

fans, roof fans, etc.) .....1.00  

(h)  Motors.  

One to six hp, per .....$3.00  

Over six hp, per hp .....0.50  

(i)Transformers, generators, capacitors, UPS systems and similar equipment.  

All types, 600 volts or under per Kva .....$0.20  

(j)Other kw rated equipment.  

Up to 15 kw, per unit .....$3.00  

Each additional kw .....0.20  

(k)  Temporary service pole .....$5.00  

(l)  Pools .....$25.00  

(m)  Manufactured/mobile home connects .....$15.00  

(n)  Mobile offices, construction site offices and similar buildings, per .....$10.00  

(o)  Signs.  

Single circuit—Connect or disconnect and reconnect .....$10.00  



Each additional circuit, per .....5.00  

(p)  Outside circuits.  

Single circuit .....$10.00  

Each additional circuit .....5.00  

(q)  Sign inspections. In shop or on job site:  

First circuit .....$10.00  

Each additional circuit, per .....5.00  

(r)  Fuel dispensing units, per .....$10.00  

(s)  Medical equipment.  

(Units)—Including x-ray and dental units, per .....$10.00  

(t)  Transfer switches—All types .....$10.00  

(u)  Reconnection of disconnected services.  

Commercial (C-10) .....$10.00  

Residential (R-10) .....$10.00  

(v)  General repair of services, branch circuits, appliances, etc. .....$10.00  

(w)  Major repair—Requiring several inspections or work done in stages .....$20.00  

(x)  Sub-panels and feeder additions to existing buildings or structures. 

  

Up to 100 amps ..... $6.00 
 200 amps ..... 8.00 
 400 amps ..... 10.00 
 600 amps ..... 15.00 
 800 amps and over ..... 20.00 

  

(y)  Reinspection fees.  

First reinspection .....N/C  

Second reinspection .....$25.00  

Third reinspection (plus previous reinspection) .....50.00  

All additional reinspection (plus previous reinspection) .....50.00  

Fees for old work shall be the same as new work. Any outlets added to old or new work will carry 

inspection fees.  

(z)  Fees for late permits. Any person, firm or corporation failing to obtain an electrical permit prior 

to the commencement of work, shall be required to then pay for such permit an amount equal to 

double the amount for the same permit had it been obtained prior to commencement; provided, 

however, that the provisions hereof shall not apply when the work must be done immediately because 

of an emergency, in which event, the electrical contractor shall telephone the office of the city 

electrical division and report the emergency and the extent of the work to be done and then obtain 

the electrical permit within the next 24 hours, or if the office of the city electrical division is not open 

for business, then the electrical contractor shall obtain the electrical permit within the next 48 hours 

immediately following the beginning of the work.  

 

 This ordinance shall become effective upon passage, approval and publication or as otherwise 

provided by law. 

 Councillor Lee made a motion to adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion 

carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 
 

 



The Clerk stated this was the time and place for the public hearing on proposed 

Ordinance the “Technical Codes of the City of Montgomery”: consisting of:   International 

Building Code 2015, International Fuel Gas Code 2015, International Mechanical Code 

2015, International Plumbing Code 2015, International Property Maintenance Code 2015, 

International Residential Code 2015, International Energy Conservation Code 2015, 

International Existing Building Code 2015, and International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 

2015, with deletions and amendments, and repealing Code of Ordinances, Chapter 5, 

Articles I, III, V, VI, VII and IX.   No one was present representing this item.  No one was 

present in opposition to this item.  The Chairman declared that the public hearing was 

closed. 

 

   The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed ordinance: 

 

 ORDINANCE NO. 22-2017 

 

Whereas, Ala. Code § 11-45-1 (1975) authorizes municipalities to adopt ordinances that 

allow the municipality to provide for the safety, preserve the health, promote the prosperity and 

improve the morals, order, comfort and convenience of its inhabitants; and  

Whereas, the adoption of a unified, model code regulating and governing the construction 

and erection of buildings and structures serves to preserve the public safety, welfare, and promotes 

the order and convenience of the citizens of Montgomery; and 

Whereas, The City of Montgomery, Alabama desires to adopt the 2015 Editions of the 

“Technical Codes of the City of Montgomery” to regulate and govern the construction and erection 

of buildings and structures and provide the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other 

physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for 

occupation and use within the corporate limits and police jurisdiction of the City of Montgomery, 

Alabama.   

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA that Ordinances 

Numbers 36-92, 6-2004, 7-2004 31-2000, 72-2005, 59-88 and 24-90 (otherwise known as City of 

Montgomery Code of Ordinances Chapter 5, Articles I, III, V, VI, VII and IX) are hereby repealed 

and the following ordinance is hereby adopted: 

Section I. Adoption of the Technical Codes. 

The “Technical Codes of the City of Montgomery”, consisting of “International Building Code 

2015, International Fuel Gas Code 2015, International Mechanical Code 2015, International 

Plumbing Code 2015, International Property Maintenance Code 2015, International Residential 

Code 2015, International Energy Conservation Code 2015, International Existing Building Code 

2015, and International Swimming Pool and Spa Code 2015,” all of which are published by the 

International Code Council, (located at 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 

22041-3401) of which three (3) copies of each are filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of 

Montgomery, Alabama, be and are hereby adopted, in the respective sections below, as the 

“Technical Codes of the City of Montgomery.” These codes are adopted for regulating and 

governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings, and structures; by providing 

the standards to insure structures are safe, sanitary, and fit for occupation and use; providing for 

the issuance of permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, 

provisions, penalties, conditions terms of said “Technical Codes”, to include related portions of 

City of Montgomery Code of Ordinances, on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are 

hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 

additions, insertions, deletions, and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

Section II Deletions and amendments to the International Building Code (IBC) as adopted: 

A)  The “International Building Code 2015” published by the International Code Council, 5203 

Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) copies have been 

and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, be and is hereby 

adopted as the “Building Code of the City of Montgomery” for regulating and governing the 

conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards 

to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; providing for the issuance of 

permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 

conditions terms of said “Building Code” on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are hereby 

referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, 

insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

1. Subsection 101.1 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 



Subsection 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Technical Code of the 

City of Montgomery, Alabama hereafter referred to as “this code.” 

2. Subsection 101.2.1 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 101.2.1 Appendices.  Provisions of the following appendices are hereby 

adopted: 

1. Appendix A “ Employee Qualifications” 

2. Appendix B  “Board of Appeals”  

3. Appendix C  “Group U-Agricultural Buildings” 

4. Appendix F  “Rodent proofing” 

5. Appendix H  “Signs”        

6. Appendix I    “Patio Covers” 

3.  Subsection 101.4.3 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the International Plumbing Code shall 

apply to the installation, alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing systems, including 

equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to a water 

or sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas system. The provisions for private 

sewage disposal are required to comply with Montgomery County Health Department 

regulations. 

4.  Subsection 101.4.5 of the IBC is amended to read as follows:  

Subsection 101.4.5 Fire prevention.  The provisions of the International Fire Code,  as 

adopted by the City Council and enforced by the Montgomery Fire Department,  shall apply 

to matters affecting or relating to structures, processes and premises from the hazard of fire 

and explosion arising from the storage, handling or use of structures, materials or devices; 

from conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the occupancy of structures 

or premises; and from the construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire 

suppression, automatic sprinkler systems and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure 

or on the premises from occupancy or operation. 

5. Subsection 105.2 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of 

this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner 

in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this 

jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following: 

Building: 

2. Fences not over 3 feet high. 

6.  Subsection 109.2 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 109.2 Schedule of permit and other required fees. On all buildings, 

structures, gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee 

shall be paid as required at the time such permit is issued, in accordance with the following 

schedule:  

Construction cost (Referred to in schedule as Cost) shall include all fees paid to architects, 

surveyors, engineers, contractors, sub-contractors and others for services rendered or to be 

rendered in connection with construction activities. 

 

 

 

Building Permit Related Fees Fee 
License fee (applies to properties inside city limit) Cost (.0025) 
Base Permit Fee (applies to Res/Comm Building Permits) $50  
Commercial Building Permit Cost (.0025) 
Residential Building Permit Cost (.0025) 
Modular/Manufactured Structures Sngl Wide $50  
Modular/Manufactured Structures Dble Wide + $100  
Erosion control (Residential) n/c 
Erosion control (Commercial) $400  
Demolition 1 and 2 family $50  
Demolition (R3 accessory structure) $25  
Demolition (Commercial) Cost (.0025) min $50 
Moving of Structures $100  
Fences  greater than 3' Cost (.0025) min $25 
Retaining walls greater than 4' high(Not part of project) Cost (.0025) min $25 



Signs (Permanent) Cost (.0025) min $25 
Signs (Temporary-up to 365 days) $25  
Swimming Pool  (Residential) $100  
Swimming Pool (Commercial) $100  
Driveway Curb Cuts (set as minimum permit fee) $25  
Tents Fire Dept. Permit 
Cert. of Occupancy (existing bldngs)(No Change of Use) $25  
Change of Occupancy/Use (Cost of $0-$20,000) $100  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $50  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $100  
Plan Review Fee (One and Two Family Dwellings) n/c 
     1st   Resubmittal n/c 
     2nd Resubmittal n/c 
     3rd  Resubmittal n/c 
     4th  Resubmittal n/c 
Plan Review Fee (PRF) (Commercial as follows) See Below 
PRF  Greater than 2500 sf. (New Construction) $100  
PRF  Greater than 5000 sf. (New Construction) $200  
PRF  Greater than 12,000 sf. (New Construction) $300  
PRF  Greater than 24,000 sf. (New Construction) $400  
PRF  Greater than 50,000 sf. (New Construction) $500  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $100,000. (Existing) $100  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $250,000.(Existing) $200  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $600,000.(Existing) $300  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $1,000,000.(Existing) $400  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $2,500,000.(Existing) $500  
     1st   Resubmittal n/a 
     2nd Resubmittal n/a 
     3rd  Resubmittal n/a 
     4th  Resubmittal  n/a 
Building Code Board of Appeals $500  
Copy Fee $5  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 
A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

 

7. Subsection 109.4 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who 

commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing 

system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a fee equal to 100 % of 

the permit fee in addition to the required permit fees. 

 

 

8. Subsection 111.1 of the IBC is added to read as follows: 

Subsection 111.1 Repairs to public property. If, as a result of construction, public 

property (such as sidewalks, curbs, streets, and driveways) is damaged, such damage shall 

be repaired or replaced and inspected before a certificate of approval is issued.  

(Code 1980, § 41-73; Ord. No. 59-88, § 10, 9-20-1988) 

9. Subsection 112.3 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 112.3 Authority to disconnect service utilities. The building official shall 

have the authority to authorize disconnection of utility service to the building, structure or 

system regulated by this code and the referenced codes and standards set forth in Section 

101.4 in case of emergency where necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or 

property or where such utility connection has been made without the approval required by 

Section 112.1 or 112.2 or where deemed necessary to abate code violations in reference to 

this code and other referenced codes. The building official shall notify the serving utility, 

and wherever possible the owner and occupant of the building, structure or service system 

of the decision to disconnect prior to taking such action. If not notified prior to 

disconnecting, the owner or occupant of the building, structure or service system shall be 

notified in writing, as soon as practical thereafter. 



10. Subsection 310.5.1 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

310.5.1 Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities for five or fewer persons 

receiving care that are within a single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the 

International Residential Code.  

11. Subsection 419.5 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

 

419.5 Fire protection. The live/work unit shall be provided with a monitored fire alarm 

system where required by Section 907.2.9 and an automatic sprinkler system in accordance 

with Section 903.2.8. 

 Exception: One and two family dwellings and townhouses in accordance with IRC 

101.2. 

 

12. Subsection 901.3 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 901.3 Modifications. Persons shall not remove or modify any fire protection 

system installed or maintained under the provisions of this code or the International Fire 

Code without approval by the building official and fire code official. 

13. Subsection 1106.1 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

1106.1 Required. Where parking is provided, accessible parking spaces shall be provided 

within parking decks in compliance with Table 1106.1, except as required by Sections 

1106.2 through 1106.4. Where more than one parking facility is provided on a site, the 

number of parking spaces required to be accessible shall be calculated separately for each 

parking facility. Exception: This section does not apply to parking spaces used exclusively 

for buses, trucks, other delivery vehicles, law enforcement vehicles or vehicular impound 

and motor pools where lots accessed by the public are provided with an accessible 

passenger loading zone. 

 

14.  Subsections 1612.3 of the IBC is amended to read as follows: 

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the 

applicable governing authority shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The 

flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified 

by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report entitled “The 

Flood Insurance Study for Montgomery County, Alabama” dated January 7, 2015, as 

amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood 

Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data along with any revisions 

thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference 

and declared to be part of this section. 

See also Flood Damage Prevention Ordinance/Article 

15.  Chapter 27 of the IBC is deleted.  Refer to Electrical Ordinance for all electrical installations. 

16. Subsection 3202.2 of the IBC is amended to read as follows:  

Subsection 3202.2 Encroachments above grade and below 8 feet in height. 
Encroachments into the public right-of-way above grade and below 8 feet (2438 mm) in 

height shall be prohibited except as provided for in Sections 3202.2.1 through 3202.2.3. 

Where width of right-of-way permits, doors and windows may open into the public right-

of-way a maximum of 48”. Such openings must be accompanied by permanently 

constructed guards/buffers no greater than 42” in height to prevent impact by passing 

pedestrians.  

Section III. Deletions and amendments to the International Plumbing Code (IPC) as 

adopted: 

A)  The “International Plumbing Code 2015” published by the International Code Council, 5203 

Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) copies have been 

and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, be and is hereby 

adopted as the “Plumbing Code of the City of Montgomery” for regulating and governing the 

conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards 

to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; providing for the issuance of 

permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 

conditions terms of said “Plumbing Code” on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are 

hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 

additions, insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

1. Subsection 101.2 of the IPC is amended to read as follows: 



Subsection 101.2 Scope. The provisions of this code shall apply to the erection, 

installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of 

plumbing systems within this jurisdiction. This code shall also regulate nonflammable 

medical gas, inhalation anesthetic, vacuum piping, nonmedical oxygen systems and 

sanitary and condensate vacuum collection systems. The installation of fuel gas distribution 

piping and equipment, fuel-gas-fired water heaters and water heater venting systems shall 

be regulated by the International Fuel Gas Code. Provisions in the appendices shall not 

apply unless specifically adopted. The provisions for private sewage disposal are required 

to comply with Montgomery County Health Department regulations. 

2. Subsection 106.6.2 of the IPC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 106.6.2 Fee Schedule. The fees for all plumbing work shall be as indicated in 

the following schedule:  

 

 

 

 

 

Plumbing Permit Related Fees  Fee  
Base Fee $25  
For Each Fixture $3  
House Sewer $5  
Electric Water Heater $5  
Dishwasher $3  
Garbage Disposal $3  
Washing Machine $3  
Rain Leader, Roof Drain Piping $3  
Ejectors, Pumps or Sumps $3  
Repair or Alterations To Drain or Vent Pipes $3  
For Vacuum Breaker or $3  
Backflow Protective Devices $3  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $25  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $50  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 
A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

Gas Permit Related Fees Fee 
Base Fee $25  
Fixtures Up to 5 Per Fixture $5  
Additional Fixture Over 5 Per Fixture $3  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $25  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $50  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 
A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

 

3. Subsection 106.6.3 of the IPC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 106.6.3 Fee refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as 

follows: 

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected. 

2. Not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the permit fee paid when no work 

has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code.  

3. Not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the plan review fee paid when an 

application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or 

canceled before any plan review effort has been expended. 

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon 

written application filed by the original permittee not later than one hundred eighty 

(180) days after the date of fee payment. 

4. Subsection 108.4 of the IPC is amended to read as follows: 

108.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 

fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair 



plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 

code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

guilty of a Misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars 

($500.00) or by imprisonment not exceeding one hundred eighty (180) days or both such 

fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served 

shall be deemed a separate offense. 

 

5. Subsection 108.5 of the IPC is amended to read as follows: 

108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official, work on any plumbing 

system that is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe 

manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the 

owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice 

shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency 

exists, the code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the 

work. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been 

served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to 

remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than one hundred 

dollars ($100) or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) 

6. Subsection 301.3 of the IPC is amended to read as follows: 

301.3 Connections to drainage system. Plumbing fixtures, drains, appurtenances and 

appliances used to receive or discharge liquid wastes or sewage shall be directly connected 

to the sanitary drainage system of the building or premises, in accordance with the 

requirements of this code. This section shall not be construed to prevent indirect waste 

systems required by Chapter 8. 

7. Chapter 14 of the IPC is deleted. 

Section IV. Deletions and amendments to the International Mechanical   Code (IMC) as 

adopted:  
A)  The “International Mechanical Code 2015” published by the International Code Council, 5203 

Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) copies have been 

and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, be and is hereby 

adopted as the “Mechanical Code of the City of Montgomery” for regulating and governing the 

conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards 

to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; providing for the issuance of 

permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 

conditions terms of said “Mechanical Code” on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are 

hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 

additions, insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

1. Subsection 101.2 of the IMC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 101.2 Scope. This code shall regulate the design, installation, maintenance, 

alteration and inspection of mechanical systems that are permanently installed and utilized 

to provide control of environmental conditions and related processes within buildings. This 

code shall also regulate those mechanical systems, system components, equipment and 

appliances specifically addressed herein. The installation of fuel gas distribution piping and 

equipment, fuel gas-fired appliances and fuel gas-fired appliance venting systems shall be 

regulated by the International Fuel Gas Code. 

2. Subsection 106.5.2 of the IMC is amended to read as follows: 

106.5.2 Fee schedule. The fees for mechanical work shall be as indicated in the following 

schedule.  

 

 

 

 

Mechanical Permit Related Fees  Fee  
Base Fee      $25  
A/C WITH OR WITHOUT HEATING (Including Mini-Split)   
Up to and Including 3 Tons $10  
Over 3 Tons and Including 5 Tons $15  
Over 5 Tons and Including 10 Tons $18  
Over 10 Tons - Each Ton Over $3  
Per Heating Coil $3  
Thru Wall Units - Heating or Cooling Per Unit $7  



Cooling Tower (Water) $10  
Duct Work Only Base Fee 
Boilers $20  
Gas or Electric Heater Per Unit $6  
Ventilation Hood Per Hood $50  
Incinerators $50  
Vent Fans Each Fan $1  
Commercial Dryers $5  
VAV/PIU Box Each $1  
Fire Dampers Each $2  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $25  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $50  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 

A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

Refrigeration Permit Related Fees Fee 
Base Fee $25  
Up To and Including 3 H.P. $10  
Over 3 H.P. and Including 10 H.P. $15  
Over 10 H.P. and Including 20 H.P. $18  
Over 20 H.P. Each H.P. Over $3  
Chiller Per Ton $0.50  
Each Cooling Unit $3  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $25  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $50  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 
A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

Gas Permit Related Fees Fee 
Base Fee $25  
Fixtures Up to 5 Per Fixture $5  
Additional Fixture Over 5 Per Fixture $3  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $25  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $50  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 
A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

 

3. Subsection 106.5.3 of the IMC is amended to read as follows:      

 106.5.3 Fee refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows. 

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or 

collected. 

2. Not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the permit fee paid when no work 

has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. 

3. Not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the plan review fee paid when an 

application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or 

canceled before any plan review effort has been expended.  

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon 

written application filed by the original permittee not later than one hundred eighty 

(180) days after the date of fee payment.  

4. Subsection 108.4 of the IMC is amended to read as follows: 

108.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail 

to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair 

mechanical work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 

code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 

guilty of a Misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars 

($500.00) or by imprisonment not exceeding one hundred eighty (180) days or both such 

fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served 

shall be deemed a separate offense. 

5. Subsection 108.5 of the IMC is amended to read as follows: 



108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official that mechanical work is being 

done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work 

shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of 

the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state 

the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the 

code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any 

person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop 

work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation 

or unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine of not less than one hundred dollars ($100.00) 

or more than five hundred dollars ($500.00).   

6. Subsection 403.3 of the IMC is amended to read as follows:  

403.3 Outdoor air and local exhaust airflow rates. Group R-2, R-3 and R-4 occupancies 

three stories and less in height above grade plane shall be provided with outdoor air and 

local exhaust in accordance with Section 403.3.2. All other buildings intended to be 

occupied shall be provided with outdoor air and local exhaust in accordance with Section 

403.3.1. 

  Exception: One and two family dwellings shall comply with the following: 

 

 
M1507.4 Local exhaust rates. Local exhaust systems shall be designed to have the capacity to 

exhaust the minimum air flow rate determined in accordance with Table M1507.4. 

 
Section IV. Deletions and Revisions to the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) as adopted: 

1. Subsection 101.2 of the IFGC is amended to read as follows: 

Subsection 101.2 Scope. This code shall apply to the installation of fuel-gas piping 

systems, fuel gas appliances, gaseous hydrogen systems and related accessories in 

accordance with Sections 101.2.1 through 101.2.5.  

2. Subsection 106.6.2 of the IFGC is amended to read as follows: 

106.6.2 Fee Schedule. The fees for work shall be as indicated in the following schedule.  

Gas Permit Related Fees Fee 
Base Fee $25  
Fixtures Up to 5 Per Fixture $5  
Additional Fixture Over 5 Per Fixture $3  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $25  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $50  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 

A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 
 

3. Subsection 106.6.3 of the IFGC is amended to read as follows: 

 106.6.3 Fee Refunds. The code official shall authorize the refunding of fees as follows. 



1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or 

collected. 

2. Not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the permit fee paid when no work 

has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. 

3. Not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the plan review fee paid when an 

application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or 

canceled before any plan review effort has been expended. 

The code official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon 

written application filed by the original permittee not later than one hundred eighty 

(180) days after the date of fee payment. 

4. Subsection 108.4 of the IFGC is amended to read as follows: 

108.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code, fail to 

comply with any of the requirements thereof or erect, install, alter or repair work in 

violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a 

permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a 

Misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by 

imprisonment not exceeding one hundred eighty (180) days, or both such fine and 

imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall 

be deemed a separate offense. 

5. Subsection 108.5 of the IFGC is amended to read as follows: 

108.5 Stop Work Orders. Upon notice from the code official that work is being done 

contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shall 

immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the 

property, the owner’s agent, or the person doing the work. The notice shall state the 

conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code 

official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any person 

who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop work order, 

except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 

condition, shall be liable for a fine of not less than one hundred dollars ($100.00) or more 

than five hundred dollars ($500.00). 

Section V Deletions and amendments to the International Residential Code (IRC) as 

adopted: 

A)  The “International Residential Code 2015” published by the International Code Council, 5203 

Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) copies have been 

and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, be and is hereby 

adopted as the “Residential Code of the City of Montgomery” for regulating and governing the 

conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards 

to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; providing for the issuance of 

permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 

conditions terms of said “Residential Code” on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are 

hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 

additions, insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

 

1. Subsection R101.2 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

R101.2 Scope. The provisions of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-

family  Dwellings shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, 

replacement,  repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of 

detached one- and  two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories 

above grade plane in height  with a separate means of egress and their accessory 

structures. 

  Exceptions: 

 1. Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of the 

International Building Code shall be permitted to be built as one- and two-family 

dwellings or townhouses.  

2. Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted 

to be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- 

and Two-family Dwellings.  

2. Subsection R102.5 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

 R102.5 Appendices. Provisions of the following appendices are hereby adopted: 

  1. Appendix E  “Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings” 

  2. Appendix H “Patio Covers” 

  3. Appendix J  “Existing Buildings and Structures” 



4. Appendix M  “Home Daycare-R3 

3. Subsection 105.2 of the IRC is amended to read as follows:  

R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemption from permit requirements of this code 

shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in 

violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. 

Permits shall not be required for the following: 

2. Fences not over 3 feet high. 

4. Subsection R108.2 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

108.2 Schedule of permit and other required fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, 

gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each 

permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the following schedule: 

Construction cost (Referred to in schedule as Cost) shall include all fees paid to architects, 

surveyors, engineers, contractors, sub-contractors and others for services rendered or to be 

rendered in connection with construction activities.  

Building Permit Related Fees Fee 
License fee (applies to properties inside city limit) Cost (.0025) 
Base Permit Fee (applies to Res/Comm Building Permits) $50  
Commercial Building Permit Cost (.0025) 
Residential Building Permit Cost (.0025) 
Modular/Manufactured Structures Sngl Wide $50  
Modular/Manufactured Structures Dble Wide + $100  
Erosion control (Residential) n/c 
Erosion control (Commercial) $400  
Demolition 1 and 2 family $50  
Demolition (R3 accessory structure) $25  
Demolition (Commercial) Cost (.0025) min $50 
Moving of Structures $100  
Fences  greater than 3' Cost (.0025) min $25 
Retaining walls greater than 4' high(Not part of project) Cost (.0025) min $25 
Signs (Permanent) Cost (.0025) min $25 
Signs (Temporary-up to 365 days) $25  
Swimming Pool  (Residential) $100  
Swimming Pool (Commercial) $100  
Driveway Curb Cuts (set as minimum permit fee) $25  
Tents Fire Dept. Permit 
Cert. of Occupancy (existing bldngs)(No Change of Use) $25  
Change of Occupancy/Use (Cost of $0-$20,000) $100  
First Re-Inspection Fee (2nd Trip) n/c 
Second Re-Inspection Fee (3rd Trip) $50  
Third and any Subsequent Re-Inspections Fee (4th Trip) $100  
Plan Review Fee (One and Two Family Dwellings) n/c 
     1st   Resubmittal n/c 
     2nd Resubmittal n/c 
     3rd  Resubmittal n/c 
     4th  Resubmittal n/c 
Plan Review Fee (PRF) (Commercial as follows) See Below 
PRF  Greater than 2500 sf. (New Construction) $100  
PRF  Greater than 5000 sf. (New Construction) $200  
PRF  Greater than 12,000 sf. (New Construction) $300  
PRF  Greater than 24,000 sf. (New Construction) $400  
PRF  Greater than 50,000 sf. (New Construction) $500  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $100,000. (Existing) $100  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $250,000.(Existing) $200  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $600,000.(Existing) $300  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $1,000,000.(Existing) $400  
PRF Estimated Cost Greater Than $2,500,000.(Existing) $500  
     1st   Resubmittal n/a 
     2nd Resubmittal n/a 
     3rd  Resubmittal n/a 



     4th  Resubmittal  n/a 
Building Code Board of Appeals $500  
Copy Fee $5  

WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE SHALL BE SUBJECT TO 
A FEE EQUAL TO 100% OF THE ORIGINAL PERMIT FEE 

g 

5. Table R301.2 (1) of the IRC is amended to include the following geographic design criteria: 

 
6. Table R302.1 (1) and R302.1 (2) of the IRC is to be deleted and amended to read as follows: 

 
7. Subsection R302.5.1 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used 

for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and 

residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 13/8 inches (35 mm) in 

thickness, solid or honeycomb core steel doors not less than 13/8 inches (35 mm) thick, or 

20-minute fire-rated doors.  

8. Subsection R309.5 of the IRC is deleted. 

9. Subsection R313.1 of the IRC is amended to read as follows:  

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. Where installed, automatic 

residential fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 13D. 

(Sprinkler system is not required.) 

10. Subsection R313.1.1 of the IRC is to be deleted. 

 

11. Subsection R313.2 of the IRC is to be amended to read as follows:  

R313.2 One and Two-Family automatic fire sprinkler systems. Where installed, 

automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 

13D. (Sprinkler system is not required.) 

12. Subsection R313.2.1 of the IRC is to be amended to read as follows: 

R313.2.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall be 

designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 13D. 
 

13. Subsection R322.2 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

 

R322.2.1 Elevation requirements. 

 

1. Buildings and structures in flood hazard areas, including flood hazard areas 

designated as Coastal A Zones, shall have the lowest floors elevated to or above 

the base flood elevation plus 2 feet, or the design flood elevation. 

  



2. In areas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), buildings and structures shall have the 

lowest floor (including basement) elevated to a height of not less than the highest 

adjacent grade as the depth number specified in feet (mm) on the FIRM plus 2 feet, 

or not less than 3 feet (15 mm) if a depth number is not specified. 

 

3. Basement floors that are below grade on all sides shall be elevated to or above 

base flood elevation plus 2 feet, or the design flood elevation, whichever is higher. 

 

Exception: Enclosed areas below the design flood elevation, including 

basements with floors that are not below grade on all sides, shall meet the 

requirements of Section R322.2.2. 

 

14. Subsection R325.5 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

R325.5 Openness. Mezzanines shall be open and unobstructed to the room in which they 

are located except for walls not more than 42 inches (1067 mm) in height, columns and 

posts. 

 

15. Subsection R403.1.6 of the IRC is amended to read as follows: 

R403.1.6 Foundation anchorage. Wood sill plates and wood walls supported directly on 

continuous foundations shall be anchored to the foundation in accordance with this section. 

Cold-formed steel framing shall be anchored directly to the foundation or fastened to wood 

sill plates anchored to the foundation. Anchorage of cold-formed steel framing and sill 

plates supporting cold-formed steel framing shall be in accordance with this section and 

Section R505.3.1 or R603.3.1. Wood sole plates at all exterior walls on monolithic slabs, 

wood sole plates of braced wall panels at building interiors on monolithic slabs and all 

wood sill plates shall be anchored to the foundation with minimum 1/2-inchdiameter (12.7 

mm) anchor bolts spaced a maximum of 6 feet (1829 mm) on center or approved anchors 

or anchor straps spaced as required to provide equivalent anchorage to 1/2-inch-diameter 

(12.7 mm) anchor bolts. Bolts shall extend a minimum of 7 inches (178 mm) into concrete 

or grouted cells of concrete masonry units. The bolts shall be located in the middle third of 

the width of the plate. A nut and washer shall be tightened on each anchor bolt. There shall 

be a minimum of two bolts per plate section with one bolt located not more than 12 inches 

(305 mm) or less than seven bolt diameters from each end of the plate section. Interior 

bearing wall sole plates on monolithic slab foundation that are not part of a braced wall 

panel shall be positively anchored with approved fasteners. Sill plates and sole plates shall 

be protected against decay and termites where required by Sections R317 and R318.  

Exceptions: 

1. Walls 24 inches (610 mm) total length or shorter connecting offset braced wall 

panels shall be anchored to the foundation with a minimum of one anchor bolt 

located in the center third of the plate section and shall be attached to adjacent 

braced wall panels at corners as shown in Item 9 of Table R602.3(1). 

2. Connection of walls 12 inches (305 mm) total length or shorter connecting offset 

braced wall panels to the foundation without anchor bolts shall be permitted. The 

wall shall be attached to adjacent braced wall panels at corners as shown in Item 9 

of Table R602.3 (1). 

3. Where the basic wind speed in accordance with Figure R301.2 (4)A does not 

exceed 115 miles per hour (51 m/s), the seismic design category is A or B and 

Method GB in accordance with Section R602.10 is used for a braced wall line on 

the interior of the dwelling, anchor bolts shall not be required for the wood sole 

plates of the braced wall panels. Positive anchorage with approved fasteners shall 

be provided. 

16. Chapter 11 of the IRC is deleted. (See International Energy Conservation Code.) 

17. Part V- Mechanical of the IRC is deleted and the corresponding sections of the International 

Mechanical Code of the City of Montgomery, as adopted, shall apply. 

18. Part VI-Fuel Gas of the IRC is deleted and the corresponding sections of the International Fuel 

Gas Code of the City of Montgomery, as adopted, shall apply. 

19. Part VII- Plumbing of the IRC is deleted and the corresponding sections of the International 

Plumbing Code of the City of Montgomery, as adopted, shall apply. 

20. Part VIII-Electrical of the IRC is deleted and the provisions of the Electrical Ordinance of the 

City of Montgomery, as adopted by the City Council, shall apply. 

Section VI. Deletions and amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code 

(IECC) as adopted: 



A)  The “International Energy Conservation Code 2015” published by the International Code 

Council, 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) 

copies have been and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, 

Alabama, be and is hereby adopted as the “Energy Conservation Code of the City of Montgomery” 

for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and 

structures; by providing the standards to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation 

and use; providing for the issuance of permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of 

the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions terms of said “Energy Conservation Code” on file 

in the office of the City of Montgomery are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as 

if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed 

in this section. 

1. Subsection R101.5.1 of the IECC is amended to read as follows: 

R101.5.1 Compliance materials. The Alabama Residential and Energy Codes Board shall 

approve specific computer software, worksheets, compliance manuals and other similar 

materials that meet the intent of this code.  

2. Subsection R202 of the IECC is amended to read as follows: 

 

 

R202 General Definitions 

DEFINED TERMS.  
(i) Semi conditioned space. An unfinished area of the dwelling such as the attic or 

crawl space that is within the thermal envelope.  

3. Table R402.1.2 of the IECC is to be amended to read as follows: 
TABLE (R402.1.2) 

INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT a 

 
  For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm. 

  a. R-values are minimums. U-factors and SHGC are maximums. When 

insulation is installed in a cavity which is less than the label or 

design thickness of the insulation, the installed R-value of the 

insulation shall not be less than the R-value specified in the table. 

  b. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC 

column applies to all glazed fenestration. Exception: Skylights may be 

excluded from glazed fenestration SHGC requirements in climate zones 1 

through 3 where the SHGC for such skylights does not exceed 0.30. 

  c. “5/13” means R-5 continuous insulation on the interior or 

exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the 

basement wall. 

  d. Basement wall insulation is not required in warm-humid locations 

as defined by Figure R301.1 and Table R301.1. 

  e. The second R-value applies when more than half the insulation is 

on the interior of the mass wall. 

  f. Reference R402.2.2.1 

 

4. Subsection R402.2.2.1 of the IECC is added to read as follows: 

R402.2.2.1 Semi-conditioned attics. Where table N1102.1.1 (R402.1.1) requires R-30 or 

Table N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3) requires a U-Factor of 0.035, an air impermeable insulation 

installed to the roof deck with a U-Factor of 0.05 or R-value of R-20 shall be deemed 

equivalent to the provisions in N1102.2.2 (R402.2.2).  

5. Subsection 402.2.4 of the IECC is amended to read as follows: 

R402.2.4 Access hatches and doors. Access doors from conditioned spaces to 

unconditioned spaces (e.g., attics and crawl spaces) shall be weather-stripped and insulated 

to a level in accordance with the following insulation values:  

1. Hinged vertical doors shall have a maximum U-Factor of U-0.20 (R-5 minimum) 

and comply with Section R-316  

2. Hatches/scuttle hole covers shall have a maximum U-Factor of U-0.05 (R-19 

minimum) and;  

3. Pull down stairs shall have a maximum U-Factor of U-0.20 with a minimum of 

75 percent of the panel area having (R-5 minimum) insulation.  

Access shall be provided to all equipment that prevents damaging or compressing the 

insulation. A wood framed or equivalent baffle or retainer is required to be provided when 



loose fill insulation is installed the purpose of which is to prevent the loose fill insulation 

from spilling into the living space when the attic access is opened, and to provide a 

permanent means of maintaining the installed R-value of the loose fill insulation.  

6. Subsection R402.2.10 of the IECC is deleted. 

7. Subsection R402.2.11 of the IECC is amended to read as follows: 

R402.2.11 Crawl space walls. As an alternative to insulating floors over crawl spaces, 

crawl space walls shall be permitted to be insulated when the crawl space is not vented to 

the outside. The band joist shall be insulated and air sealed in accordance with Table 

N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1). A 3 inch (76mm) inspection/view strip shall be provided 

immediately below the floor joists to permit inspections for termites. Crawl space wall 

insulation shall be permanently fastened to the wall and extend downward from the bottom 

of the inspection/view strip to within 9 inches(229mm) of the finished interior grade 

adjacent to the foundation wall. Exposed earth in unvented crawl space foundations shall 

be covered with a continuous Class I vapor retarder in accordance with Section R408 of 

the International Residential Code. All joints of the vapor retarder shall overlap by 6 inches 

(153 mm) and shall extend up the stem wall not less than 6 inches (153mm) and shall be 

attached to the stem wall.  

8. Subsection R402.3.2.1 of the IECC is added to read as follows: 

R402.3.2.1 Glazed fenestration SHGC exception. Where applicable, glazed fenestration 

SHGC exception shall be as referenced in section C402.4.3. 

9. Subsection 402.4.1.2 of the IECC is amended to read as follows: 

R402.4.1.2 Testing (Mandatory). The building or dwelling unit shall be tested and 

verified as having an air leakage rate of not exceeding 5 air changes per hour. Testing shall 

be conducted with a blower door at a pressure of 0.2 inches w.g. (50 Pascals). Testing shall 

be performed at any time after creation of all penetrations of the building thermal envelope. 

During testing:  

1. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shall be closed, but not 

sealed, beyond the intended weather-stripping or other infiltration control 

measures;  

2. Dampers including exhaust, intake, makeup air, backdraft and flue dampers shall 

be closed, but not sealed beyond intended infiltration control measures;  

3. Interior doors, if installed at the time of the test, shall be open;  

4. Exterior doors for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery ventilators 

shall be closed and sealed;  

5. Heating and cooling systems, if installed at the time of the test, shall be turned 

off. 

6. Supply and return registers, if installed at the time of the test, shall be fully open.  

10. Subsection R403.1.1 of the IECC is deleted: 

11. Subsection R403.9 of the IECC is deleted: 

12. Subsection R403.10 of the IECC is deleted:  

13. Subsection R403.11 of the IECC is deleted:  

14. Subsection R403.12 of the IECC is deleted:  

15. Subsection R404.1 of the IECC Lighting equipment is amended to read as follows: 

R404.1 Lighting equipment.   Not less than 75 percent of the lamps in permanently 

installed    lighting fixtures at the time of inspection shall be high-efficacy lamps or not 

less than 75 percent of the permanently installed lighting fixtures shall contain only high 

efficacy lamps. 

16. Table R405.5.2 of the IECC is to be amended to read as follows: 
TABLE R405.5.2(1) 

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE STANDARD REFERENCE AND PROPOSED DESIGNS 

 

BUILDING STANDARD REFERENCE DESIGN PROPOSED DESIGN 
COMPONENT     

  
Type: mass wall if proposed wall is mass; otherwise wood 
frame As proposed 

Above-grade Gross area: same as proposed As proposed 

walls U-factor: as specified in Table R402.1.4 As proposed 

  Solar absorptance = 0.75 As proposed 

  Remittance = 0.90 As proposed 

Basement 
and  Type: same as proposed As proposed 



crawl space Gross area: same as proposed As proposed 

walls U-factor: as specified in Table R402.1.4 As proposed 

  Type: Wood frame As proposed 

Above-grade Gross area: same as proposed As proposed 

floors U-factor: as specified in Table R402.1.4 As proposed 

  Type: Wood frame As proposed 

Ceilings Gross area: same as proposed As proposed 

  U-factor: as specified in Table R402.1.4 As proposed 

  Type: composition shingle on wood sheathing As proposed 

Roofs Gross area: same as proposed As proposed 

  Solar absorptance = 0.75 As proposed 

  Emittance = 0.90 As proposed 

Attics Type: vented with aperture = 1 ft² per 300 ft² ceiling area As proposed 

  Type: same as proposed As proposed 

Foundations 
Foundation wall area above and below grade and soil 
characteristics: As proposed 

  same as proposed   

  Area: 40 ft² As proposed 

Opaque 
doors Orientation: North As proposed 

  U-factor: same as fenestration from Table R402.1.4 As proposed 

  Total area = 15% of the conditioned floor area As proposed 

  
Orientation: equally distributed to four cardinal compass 
orientations As proposed 

Vertical  (N, E, S, & W)   

fenestration  U-factor: from Table 402.1.4 As proposed 

other than  SHGC: from table 402.1.1 except that for climates with no  As proposed 
opaque 
doors requirement (NR) SHGC = 0.40 shall be used   

  
Interior shade fraction : 0.92-(0.21 x SHGC for the standard 
reference 

0.92-(0.21 x SHGC 
as 

  Design proposed)  

  External Shading: none As Proposed 

Skylights None As Proposed 

Thermally      
isolated None As Proposed 
sunrooms     

  
Air Leakage rate of 5 air changes per hour at a pressure of 0.2 
inches 

For tested 
residences 

  
W.g (50Pa). The mechanical ventilation rate shall be in addition 
to the  the measured air  

Air Exchange 
air leakage rate and the same as in the proposed design, but 
no  exchange rate. The  

Rate greater than 0.01 x CFA + 7.5 x (Nbr+ 1) mechanical venti- 
  where:  lation rate a shall be  

  CFA = conditioned floor area 
in addition to the 
air 

  Nbr = number of bedrooms 
leakage rate and 
shall  

  
Energy recovery shall no be assumed for mechanical 
ventilation. be as proposed.  

  None, except where mechanical ventilation is specified by the    
  proposed design, in which case:    
Mechanical Annual vent fan energy use:     
Ventilation      kWh/yr = 0.03942 x CFA + 29.565 x (Nbr = 1) As Proposed 
  where:    
  CFA = conditioned floor area   



  Nbr = number of bedrooms   

Internal 
Gains 

Igain = 17,900 + 23.8 x CFA = 4104 x Nbr (BTU/day per dwelling 
unit) Same as standard 

    reference design 

    Same as standard  

    
reference design, 
plus  

    
any additional 
mass 

Internal   
An internal mass for furniture and contents of 8 pounds per 
square 

specifically 
designed as  

Mass foot of floor area. a thermal storage  
    element b but not  

    
integral to the 
building 

    
envelope or 
structure 

  
For masonry floor slabs, 80 percent of floor area covered by R-
2 As Proposed 

  
carpet and pad, and 20 percent of floor directly exposed to 
room air.   

Structural For masonry basement walls, as proposed, but with insulation  As Proposed 

Mass 
required by Table R402.1.4 located on the interior side of the 
walls   

  
For other walls, for ceilings, floors, and interior walls, wood 
frame As Proposed 

  construction.   

    

  
Fuel Type: same as proposed design 
Efficiencies:   

  
Electric: air-source heat pump with prevailing federal 
minimum   

Heating Standards  

Systems c, d 
Non-electric furnaces: natural gas furnace with prevailing 
federal  As proposed 

  minimum standards  
  Non-electric boilers: natural gas boiler with prevailing federal   
  minimum standards  
  Capacity: sized in accordance with section N1103.7 (R403.7)  
Cooling Fuel Type: Electric As proposed 

Systems d, e 
Efficiency: In accordance with prevailing federal minimum 
standards As proposed 

  Capacity: sized in accordance with section N1103.7 (R403.7) As proposed 

  Fuel Type: same as proposed design  As proposed 

Service  
Efficiency: In accordance with prevailing federal minimum 
standards As proposed 

Water  Use: gal/day = 30 10 x Nbr As proposed 

Heating c, d, e Tank temperature: 120°F Same as standard  
    reference 

  Duct insulation: from section R403.2.1. As tested or as  

Thermal  
A thermal distribution system efficiency (DSE) of 0.88 shall be 
applied specified in Table  

Distribution 
to both the heating and cooling system efficiencies for all 
systems R405.5.2(2) if not  

Systems 
other than tested duct systems. For tested duct systems, the 
leakage  

tested. Duct 
insulation 

  
rate shall be 4 cfm (113.3L/min) per 100 ft² (9.29 m²) of 
conditioned  

shall be as 
proposed 



  floor area at a pressure differential of 0.1 inches w.g (25 Pa)     

Thermostat Type: Manual, cooling temperature set point = 75°F; Heating  Same as standard 
  temperature set point - 72°F reference 

 
For SI: 1 square foot = 0.93 m2, 1 British thermal unit = 1055 J, 1 

pound per square foot = 4.88 kg/m2, 1 gallon (US) = 3.785 L, °C = (°F-

32)/1.8, 1 degree 0.79 rad. 

a. The combined air exchange rate for infiltration and mechanical 

ventilation shall be determined in accordance with Equation 43 of 2001 

ASHRAE Handbook of Fundamentals, page 26.24 and the ”Whole-house 

Ventilation" provisions of 2001 ASH RAE Handbook of Fundamentals, page 

26.19 for intermittent mechanical ventilation. 

b. Thermal storage element shall mean a component not part of the 

floors, walls or ceilings that is part of a passive solar system, and 

that provides thermal storage such as enclosed water columns, rock 

beds, or phase-change containers. A thermal storage element must be in 

the same room as fenestration that faces within 15 degrees (0.26 rad) 

of true south, or must be connected to such a room with pipes or ducts 

that allow the element to be actively charged. 

c. For a proposed design with multiple heating, cooling or water  

design system capacities and fuel types shall be weighted in accordance 

with their respective loads as calculated by accepted engineering 

practice for each equipment and fuel type present. 

d. For a proposed design without a proposed heating system, a heating 

system with the prevailing federal minimum efficiency shall be assumed 

for both the standard reference design and proposed design. 

e. For a proposed design home without a proposed cooling system, an 

electric air conditioner with the prevailing federal minimum efficiency 

shall be assumed for both the standard reference design and the 

proposed design. 

f. For a proposed design with a nonstorage-type water heater, a 40-

gallon storage-type water heater with the prevailing federal minimum 

energy factor for the same fuel as the predominant heating fuel type 

shall be assumed. For the case of a proposed design without a proposed 

water heater, a 40-gallon storage-type water heater with the prevailing 

federal minimum efficiency for the same fuel as the predominant heating 

fuel type shall be assumed for both the proposed design and standard 

reference design. 

g. For residences with conditioned basements, R-2 and R-4 residences 

and townhouses, the following formula shall be used to determine 

glazing area: 
 

AF = As x FA x F 
where: 

AF = Total glazing area 

As = Standard reference design total glazing area. 
FA = (Above-grade thermal boundary gross wall area)/(above-grade 

boundary wall area + 0.5 x below-grade boundary wall area). 

F = (Above-grade thermal boundary wall area)/(above-grade thermal 

boundary wall area + common wall area) or 0.56, whichever is greater. 

and where: 

 Thermal boundary wall is any wall that separates conditioned space 

from unconditioned space or ambient conditions. 

 Above-grade thermal boundary wall is any thermal boundary wall 

component not in contact with soil. 

 Below-grade boundary wall is any thermal boundary wall in soil 

contact. 

 Common wall area is the area of walls shared with an adjoining 

dwelling unit. 

 L and CFA are in the same units. 

h. Applies if trade-offs from C402.4.3 are not used. 

17. Subsection R406.4 of the IECC is amended to read as follows: 

R406.4 ERI-based compliance. Compliance based on an ERI analysis requires that the 

rated design be shown to have an ERI less than or equal to a score of 70 in both zones 2 

and 3 when compared to the ERI reference design.  

 Section VII. Deletions and amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code 

(IPMC) as adopted: 



A)  The “International Property Maintenance Code 2015” published by the International Code 

Council, 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) 

copies have been and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, 

Alabama, be and is hereby adopted as the “Property Maintenance Code of the City of 

Montgomery” for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, 

buildings and structures; by providing the standards to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit 

for occupation and use; providing for the issuance of permits and collections of fees therefor; and 

each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions terms of said “Property 

Maintenance Code” on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are hereby referred to, adopted 

and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions 

and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

1. Subsection 108 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows: 

108.2 Closing of vacant structures. If the structure is vacant and unfit for human 

habitation and occupancy, and is not in danger of structural collapse, the code official is 

authorized to post a placard of condemnation on the premises and order the structure closed 

up so as not to be an attractive nuisance. Upon failure of the owner or owner’s authorized 

agent to close up the premises within the time specified in the order, the code official shall 

cause the premises to be closed and secured through any available public agency or by 

contract or arrangement by private persons and the cost thereof shall be charged against 

the real estate upon which the structure is located and shall be a lien upon such real estate 

and shall be collected by any other legal resource. 

 Procedures: 

*Verify disconnection of service utilities to the building. 

*Remove all combustible furniture, clothing, trash, debris, junk from all levels 

including the attic space and exterior. 

*Search of entire building to be conducted to ensure that it is un-occupied. 

*All opening should be secured as follows:  

Entire perimeter of openings should provide a solid, attachable surface for which 

the exterior grade sheeting (1/2 plywood, grade CDX or OSB board) may be 

attached. 

Attachment of exterior sheeting to supports should be as follows:  

◦ Minimum 1 ½" corrosion resistant nails or screws spaced not more than 

12" along the perimeter and interior supports. 

◦ Interior supports should be 2x4 nominally dimensional wood cut to fit 

against perimeter supports and anchored with four (4) 12d cement coated 

nails or equivalent on each end. The spacing of interior supports should be 

no greater than 24" O.C. 

◦ Additionally, all openings which require more than one (1) solid sheet of 

plywood or OSB board is required to be supported along all edges by interior 

supports. 

◦ Main entrance: The main entrance to the structure is required to be secured 

by ¾" CDX grade plywood or OSB board attached to perimeter supports 

with 1½" minimum corrosion resistant screws at a minimum of 12" O.C. No 

interior supports will be required for 36" x 80" openings. 

Sheeting attachment should be in such a manner as to minimize the intrusion of 

rain. 

2. Subsection 108.2.1 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows: 

Authority to disconnect service utilities. The code official shall have the authority to 

authorize disconnection of utility service to the building, structure or system regulated by 

this code and the referenced codes and standards set forth in Section 102.7 in case of 

emergency where necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property or where 

such utility connection has been made without approval or where deemed necessary to 

abate code violations in reference to this code and other referenced codes. The code official 

shall notify the serving utility and, whenever possible, the owner or owner’s authorized 

agent and occupant of the building, structure or service system of the decision to disconnect 

prior to taking such action. If not notified prior to disconnection the owner, owner’s 

authorized agent or occupant of the building structure or service system shall be notified 

in writing as soon as practical thereafter.  

3. Subsection 109.1.1 of the IPMC is added to read as follows: 



109.1.1 Demolition of buildings under emergency circumstances. The mayor or his 

designee may, pursuant to Act 02-522, now codified as Code of Ala. 1975, § 11-53b-1, as 

amended, initiate immediate repair or demolition of a building structure when, in his/her 

opinion, such emergency action is required due to the imminent danger of structural 

collapse endangering adjoining property, the public right of way or human life or health. 

The cost of the emergency action shall be fixed by the council and shall be assessed in 

accordance with the provision of Code of Ala. 1975, § 11-53b-5, as amended.  

4. Subsection 110.2 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows: 

110.2 Notices and orders. Notices and orders to comply with State of Alabama Code 11-

53-B. 

5. Subsection 302.4 of the IPMC is deleted: 

6. Subsection 302.8 of the IPMC is deleted: 

7. Subsection 302.9 of the IPMC is deleted: 

8. Subsection 302.4 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows: 

602.3 Heat supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one 

or more dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish 

heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat during the period from October 1 to April 

15 to maintain a minimum temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms 

and toilet rooms. 

Exceptions:  

1. When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature 

for the locality, maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be 

required provided that the heating system is operating at its full design capacity. 

The winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as indicated in 

Appendix D of the International Plumbing Code. 

2. In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30°F (-1°C), a 

minimum temperature of 65°F (18°C) shall be maintained. 

9. Subsection 302.5 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows: 

602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat 

during the period from October 1 to April 15 to maintain a minimum temperature of 65°F 

(18°C) during the period the spaces are occupied. 

Exceptions: 

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special 

temperature conditions. 

2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical activities.  

Section VIII. Deletions and amendments to the International Pool Spa Code (IPSC) as 

adopted:  

A)  The “International Pool Spa Code 2015” published by the International Code Council, 5203 

Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) copies have been 

and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, be and is hereby 

adopted as the “Pool Spa Code of the City of Montgomery” for regulating and governing the 

conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards 

to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; providing for the issuance of 

permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 

conditions terms of said “Pool Spa Code” on file in the office of the City of Montgomery are 

hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 

additions, insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed in this section 

1. Subsection 105.1.1 of the IPSC is added to read as follows: 

105.1.1 Disposal of excavated soil. No soil from excavation of a pool shall be dumped or 

placed on any private or public property without the written consent of the owner. This 

consent shall be submitted at the time a permit for the construction of the pool is obtained. 

Any soil or debris spilled on the public streets or sidewalks shall be removed immediately. 

Failure to do so will result in all work being stopped until it is satisfactorily removed and 

the area cleaned.  

(Code 1980, § 41-72; Ord. No. 59-88, § 9, 9-20-1988) 

2. Subsection 105.1.2 of the IPSC is added to read as follows: 

105.1.2 Health department permits and approvals. No building permit for the 

construction of any public pool/spa will be issued until plan approval from the county 

health department is obtained. Application for an operation permit for public pools/spas 

shall be made in writing to the county health department, and such permit will be issued 

by the health department after compliance with all health department regulations and 



provisions of this article. Operation permits are renewed annually by the health 

department and shall remain valid unless revoked by the health officer. No public 

swimming pool/spa shall operate without such permit. 

 

(Code 1980, § 41-65; Ord. No. 59-88, § 5(B), (C), 9-20-1988) 

3. Subsection 108.2-108.6.2 of the IPSC is deleted: 

4. Subsection 303 of the IPSC is deleted: 

5. Subsection 305.1 of the IPSC is amended to read as follows: 

305.1 General. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers for pools 

and spas containing water more than 24 inches in depth. These design controls are intended 

to provide protection against the potential drowning and near drowning by restricting 

access to such pools or spas. These requirements provide an integrated level of protection 

against potential drowning through the use of physical barriers and warning devices. 

Exceptions: 

1. Spas and hot tubs with a lockable safety cover that complies with ASTM F 1346. 

2. Swimming pools with a powered safety cover that complies with ASTM F 1346. 

6. Subsection 320.1 of the IPSC is amended to read as follows: 

320.1 Backwash water or draining water. Backwash water and draining water shall be 

discharged to the sanitary or storm sewer, or into an approved disposal system on the 

premise, or shall be disposed of by other means approved by the state or local authority. 

For one and two family dwellings, pool waste water is permitted to discharge onto the 

property on which pool is located, but in no case shall be permitted to drain onto 

surrounding property. Direct connections shall not be made between the end of the 

backwash line and the disposal system. Drains shall discharge through an air gap. 

Section IX. Deletions and amendments to the International Existing Building Code (IEBC) 

as adopted:  

A)  The “International Existing Building Code 2015” published by the International Code Council, 

5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-3401; of which three (3) copies have 

been and are now filed in the Office of City Clerk of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, be and is 

hereby adopted as the “Existing Building Code of the City of Montgomery” for regulating and 

governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing 

the standards to insure structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; providing for 

the issuance of permits and collections of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, 

provisions, penalties, conditions terms of said “Existing Building Code” on file in the office of the 

City of Montgomery are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in 

this ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and exchanges prescribed in this section. 

1. Subsection 111.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

111.3 Authority to disconnect service utilities. The code official shall have the authority 

to authorize disconnection of utility service to the building, structure or system regulated 

by this code and the referenced codes and standards in case of emergency where necessary 

to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property or where such utility connection has 

been made without the approval required by Section 111.1 or 111.2 or where deemed 

necessary to abate code violations in reference to this code and other referenced codes. The 

code official shall notify the serving utility and, wherever possible, the owner or the 

owner’s authorized agent and occupant of the building, structure or service system of the 

decision to disconnect prior to taking such action. If not notified prior to disconnecting, the 

owner or occupant of the building, structure or service system shall be notified in writing, 

as soon as practical thereafter.  

2. Subsection 116.1.1 of the IEBC is added to read as follows: 

116.1.1 Demolition of buildings under emergency circumstances. The mayor or his 

designee may, pursuant to Act 02-522, now codified as Code of Ala. 1975, § 11-53b-1, as 

amended, initiate immediate repair or demolition of a building structure when, in his/her 

opinion, such emergency action is required due to the imminent danger of structural 

collapse endangering adjoining property, the public right of way or human life or health. 

The cost of the emergency action shall be fixed by the council and shall be assessed in 

accordance with the provision of Code of Ala. 1975, § 11-53b-5, as amended.  

3. Subsection 117.2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:  

117.2 Notices and orders. Notices and orders to comply with State of Alabama Code 11-

53-B. 

Section X. Barbed wire or electrically charged fences 



Barbed wire or electrically charged fences; limitations on construction in vicinity of 

streets, walkways, roadways or thoroughfares; removal of fences in violation of 

section. 

1) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, maintain or permit to remain upon any 

property, either owned or occupied by such person as owner or tenant, along or within two 

feet of any public street, walkway, roadway or thoroughfare, any fence or barrier 

constructed, in whole or in part, of barbed wire, or of electrically charged wire, or 

electrically charged conductor of electricity.  

2) Nothing contained in this section shall be construed as prohibiting the installation or 

maintenance of electric light and power wires, telephone and telegraph wires used as such 

and otherwise installed and maintained in accordance with this Code and other ordinances 

of the city.  

3) Both the city building inspector and the city electrician, or either of them, shall have the 

authority to order the removal of such barbed wire, fence or barrier that violates this 

section. Each day's failure to remove such obstruction, after such notice to remove, shall 

constitute a separate offense.  

(Code 1980, § 29-5) 

Section XI. - Excavations for ponds, lakes and other bodies of water. 

 Excavations for ponds, lakes and other bodies of water. 

1) Planning commission approval; public hearing. Before the commencement of any 

excavation for ponds, lakes or any other bodies of water, excluding recreational swimming 

pools, in the corporate limits of the city, a plan shall first be submitted to the planning 

commission for its approval in the same and like manner as currently being reviewed under 

the guidelines of the subdivision regulations of the city. Such consideration for approval 

shall not be given until a public hearing has been held to determine whether or not such 

excavation is in the best interest of the citizens of the city.  

2) Enforcement. This section shall be enforced in the same manner as other matters arising 

under the jurisdiction of the planning commission.  

(Code 1980, § 40-26.1; Ord. No. 54-87, §§ 1, 2, 7-21-1987) 

 

 Councillor Lee made a motion to adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion 

carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 45-2017 

 

WHEREAS, PRA Operating LLC, d/b/a Z Tec 645, 1300 Eastern Boulevard, has filed 

an application for Retail Beer (Off Premises Only) and Retail Table Wine (Off Premises 

Only) Licenses, as indicated on the application form of the State of Alabama Alcoholic 

Beverage Control Board: 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, PRA Operating LLC, d/b/a Z Tec 645, 1300 Eastern 

Boulevard, be and is hereby approved for Retail Beer (Off Premises Only) and Retail Table 

Wine (Off Premises Only) License, and concurrence in the issuance of the license by the State 

of Alabama Alcoholic Beverage Control Board.  

Mr. Hemangkumar Padhiar was present representing this item. 

 

  Councillor Bollinger made a motion to adopt the foregoing resolution, which motion 

carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 



ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed authorization of demolition of an unsafe structure at 504 W. Patton Avenue. 

 

 Councillor Lee requested this item be carried over to the next regular council 

meeting, which was the consensus of the Council. 

 

  The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed ordinance: 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 23-2017 

 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND ORDINANCE NO. 30-2000  

FOR A REVISED MASTER PLAN. 

 

 SECTION 1: BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Ordinance No. 30-2000 be and is hereby amended to 

approve a Revised Master Plan for a PUD (Planned Unit Development) Zoning District, to 

allow senior living  whereas commercial use was approved of the following parcel: 

 

COMMENCE AT A FOUND 1/2" REBAR LYING AT THE NORTHEAST 

CORNER OF THE SOUTHWEST QUARTER OF SECTION 21, T-16-N, R-19-E, 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA; THENCE RUN N 90°00’00” E, 710.86 

FEET TO A POINT; THENCE RUN N 00°00’00” E, 963.36 FEET TO A FOUND 

5/8” REBAR (GMC CAP CA00156) LYING IN A CURVE AT THE 

INTERSECTION OF THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF LOT 3, ACCORDING TO 

THE MAP OF EASTCHASE PLAZA AND RECORDED IN THE OFFICE OF THE 

JUDGE OF PROBATE OF MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA, IN PLAT 

BOOK 50 AT PAGE 76 WITH THE WEST RIGHT OF WAY OF EASTCHASE 

LANE (ROW VARIES), SAID POINT BEING THE POINT OF BEGINNING; 

THENCE FROM SAID POINT OF BEGINNING, RUN ALONG THE EAST LINE 

OF SAID LOT 3, N 24°02’50” E, 431.80 FEET TO A FOUND 5/8” REBAR (GMC 

CAP CA00156); THENCE CONTINUE ALONG SAID EAST LINE, N 05°15’56” W, 

401.24 FEET TO A FOUND 5/8” REBAR (GMC CAP CA00156) LYING ON THE 

EAST LINE OF LOT 6 OF SAID EASTCHASE PLAZA PLAT; THENCE RUN 

ALONG SAID EAST LINE OF LOT 6, N 14°02’51” E, 444.45 FEET TO A FOUND 

1/2” REBAR (GMC CAP CA00156) LYING AT THE INTERSECTION OF SAID 

EAST LINE OF LOT 6 WITH THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF LOT 1, 

ACCORDING TO THE MAP OF EASTCHASE CENTRAL PLAT 1 AND 

RECORDED IN THE OFFICE OF THE JUDGE OF PROBATE OF 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA, IN PLAT BOOK 55 AT PAGE 139; 

THENCE RUN ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID LOT 1, S 75°57’09” E, 490.15 

FEET TO A FOUND  1/2" REBAR (GMC CAP CA00156) LYING IN A CURVE AT 

THE INTERSECTION OF SAID SOUTH LINE OF LOT 1 WITH THE 

AFOREMENTIONED WEST RIGHT OF WAY OF EASTCHASE LANE; 

THENCE RUN ALONG SAID WEST RIGHT OF WAY AND SAID CURVE 

(CONCAVE SOUTHEASTERLY, R=500.48’), A CHORD OF S 32°44’22” W, 476.74 

FEET TO A FOUND 5/8” REBAR (GMC CAP CA00156); THENCE CONTINUE 

ALONG SAID WEST RIGHT OF WAY, S 04°17’47” W, 120.00 FEET TO A FOUND 

5/8” REBAR (GMC CAP CA00156) LYING AT THE BEGINNING OF A CURVE; 

THENCE CONTINUE ALONG SAID WEST RIGHT OF WAY AND SAID CURVE 

(CONCAVE WESTERLY, R=670.23’), A CHORD OF S 37°53’55” W, 741.84 FEET 

TO THE POINT OF BEGINNING.  SAID DESCRIBED PROPERTY LYING AND 

BEING SITUATED IN THE NORTHEAST QUARTER OF SECTION 21, T-16-N, 

R-19-E, MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA, AND CONTAINS 7.81 ACRES 

(340,197 S.F.), MORE OR LESS. 
 

 SECTION 2.  This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and 

publication, or as otherwise provided by law. 



 Mr. Tommy Tyson was present representing the Planning Commission.  No one was 

present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item. 

 

 Councillor Bollinger made a motion to sustain the recommendation of the Planning 

Commission and adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed ordinance: 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 24-2017 

 

 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, 

ALABAMA as follows: 

 

 SECTION 1.  That the Zoning Ordinance of Montgomery, Alabama, adopted 

September 17, 1963, be amended by removing the following described property from an 

AGR-1 (Residential Agriculture) Zoning District to an R-75-d (Duplex Residential) Zoning 

District. 

 

Commencing at a point where the south right-of-way of Ashley Road intersects with 

the west line of Lot 16 according to subdivision of Westview Gardens, as recorded in 

the Office of the Judge of Probate of Montgomery County, Alabama, in Plat Book 3, 

at Page 27; said subdivision being in Sections 20 and 21, T16, R17; thence S61°30’E 

a distance of 100 ft. to the point of beginning of the property herein described; thence 

continuing S61°30’E along the South right-of-way of Ashley Road a distance of 150 

ft.; thence S6°30’E and parallel to the west line of Lot 16 a distance of 150 ft.; thence 

N61°30’W and parallel to the south right-of-way of Ashley Road a distance of 150 ft.; 

thence N6°30’W and parallel to the west line of Lot 16 a distance of 150 ft. to the point 

of beginning and containing 0.3 acres more or less; said lot being a portion of Lot 16 

according to the Map of Westview Gardens as the same appears of record in the 

Office of the Judge of Probate of Montgomery County, Alabama in Plat Book 3, at 

page 27; the property herein described also lying and being situated in the NW ¼ of 

the SE ¼ of Section 20, T16, R17. 

 

 

 SECTION 2.  This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and 

publication, or as otherwise provided by law. 

 Mr. Tommy Tyson was present representing the Planning Commission.  No one was 

present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item. 

 

 Councillor Green made a motion to adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion 

carried with the following vote: 

 

 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed ordinance: 

 



ORDINANCE NO. 25-2017 

  

 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, 

ALABAMA as follows: 

 

 SECTION 1.  That the Zoning Ordinance of Montgomery, Alabama, adopted 

September 17, 1963, be amended by removing the following described property from an M-

3 (General Industrial) Zoning District to an R-125 (Single-Family Residential) Zoning 

District. 

 

Beginning at a point on the west line of the east ½ of the east ½ of Section 8, T16N, 

R17E, a distance of 308 ft. south of the intersection of the west line of the east ½ of the 

east ½ of said Section 8, T16N, R17E, and the southwesterly right-of-way line of the 

Norfolk Southern Corporation Railroad; thence N80°39’39”E, 126.52 ft. to the said 

southwesterly right-of-way line; thence S20°58’10”E along said line 412.18 ft.; thence 

S72°54’58”W, 165.73 ft.; thence S17°53’09”E, 23.99 ft.; thence S69°01’05”W, 115.16 

ft.; thence N01°39’13”W, 477.30 ft. to the point of beginning.  Said land lies in the east 

half of the east half of Section 8, T16N, R17E, Montgomery County, Alabama 

containing 1.99 acres more or less. 

 

 SECTION 2.  This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and 

publication, or as otherwise provided by law. 

 Mr. Tommy Tyson was present representing the Planning Commission.  No one was 

present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item. 

 

 Councillor Larkin made a motion to sustain the recommendation of the Planning 

Commission and adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed ordinance: 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 26-2017 

  

 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, 

ALABAMA as follows: 

 

 SECTION 1.  That the Zoning Ordinance of Montgomery, Alabama, adopted 

September 17, 1963, be amended by removing the following described property from R-60-

d (Duplex Residential) and M-1 (Light Industrial) Zoning Districts to an M-3 (General 

Industrial) Zoning District. 

 

COMMENCE AT A 1 1/2" STEEL ROD FOUND AT THE NW CORNER OF 

SECTION 7, T16N, R18E, MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA; THENCE 

N89°25'45"E, ALONG THE NORTH LINE OF SAID SECTION 7, A DISTANCE 

OF 133.88 FEET TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR FOUND (L&O CA-0031) LYING 50 

FEET EAST OF THE CENTERLINE OF THE CSX TRANSPORTATION, INC. 

MAIN TRACK, SAID POINT BEING THE POINT OF BEGINNING; THENCE 

ALONG SAID SECTION LINE N89°25'45"E, A DISTANCE OF 577.13 FEET TO 

A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS); THENCE LEAVING SAID SECTION 

LINE, S00°18'19"E, A DISTANCE OF 179.80 FEET TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR 

SET (CA-1037LS); THENCE S86°28'11"E, A DISTANCE OF 253.03 FEET TO A 

1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS) ON THE WEST LINE OF THE MOSES 

BROTHERS SUBDIVISION OF SCOTT'S PLAT OF MONTGOMERY AS 



RECORDED IN THE OFFICE OF THE JUDGE OF PROBATE OF 

MONTGOMERY COUNTY IN PLAT BOOK 1, PAGE 34; THENCE N01°01'06"W, 

ALONG THE WEST LINE OF SAID PLAT, A DISTANCE OF 156.56 FEET TO A 

1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS) AT THE NW CORNER OF LOT 8, 

BLOCK 2 OF SAID PLAT, SAID POINT ALSO LYING ON THE SOUTH RIGHT 

OF WAY OF CLISBY PARK (40' RIGHT OF WAY); THENCE N89°28'05"E, 

ALONG THE NORTH LINE OF SAID BLOCK 2, A DISTANCE OF 220.00 FEET 

TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS) AT THE NE CORNER OF LOT 1, 

BLOCK 2 OF SAID PLAT, SAID POINT ALSO BEING THE INTERSECTION OF 

THE WEST RIGHT OF WAY OF McDONOUGH STREET (60' RIGHT OF WAY) 

AND THE SOUTH RIGHT OF WAY OF CLISBY PARK (40' RIGHT OF WAY); 

THENCE S01°01'06"E, ALONG SAID WEST RIGHT OF WAY AND EAST LINE 

OF BLOCKS 2 AND 3 OF SAID PLAT, A DISTANCE OF 326.84 FEET TO A 1/2" 

CAPPED REBAR FOUND (L&O CA-0031) AT THE SE CORNER OF LOT 4, 

BLOCK 3 OF SAID PLAT, SAID POINT ALSO BEING THE INTERSECTION OF 

THE SAID WEST RIGHT OF McDONOUGH STREET AND THE NORTH RIGHT 

OF WAY OF PRINCE STREET (45' RIGHT OF WAY); THENCE S89°28'05"W, 

ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF BLOCK 3 OF SAID PLAT AND THE NORTH 

RIGHT OF WAY OF SAID PRINCE STREET, A DISTANCE OF 220.00 FEET TO 

A "MAG" NAIL SET AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF LOT 7, BLOCK 3 OF 

SAID PLAT; THENCE S85°31'57"W, ALONG THE NORTH MARGIN OF 

PRINCE STREET, A DISTANCE OF 255.25 FEET TO A 1/2" SPIKE FOUND; 

THENCE SOUTHWESTERLY ALONG THE NORTH MARGIN OF PRINCE 

STREET AND THE NORTH LINE OF A 45 FEET IN WIDTH STREET 

EASEMENT THE FOLLOWING 2 COURSES: 1) S85°05'24"W, A DISTANCE OF 

190.07 FEET TO A 1/2" REBAR FOUND; 2) S85°07'58"W, A DISTANCE OF 134.46 

FEET TO A 5/8" REBAR FOUND AT THE INTERSECTION OF SAID NORTH 

MARGIN OF PRINCE STREET AND THE WEST MARGIN OF NORTH PERRY 

STREET; THENCE LEAVING SAID INTERSECTION, N81°03'55"W, A 

DISTANCE OF 226.89 FEET TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS); 

THENCE S03°59'39"W, A DISTANCE OF 65.41 FEET TO A 1/2" CAPPED 

REBAR SET (CA-1037LS); THENCE S11°10'55"W, A DISTANCE OF 72.69 FEET 

TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS); THENCE S14°44'28"W, A 

DISTANCE OF 239.56 FEET TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-1037LS) 50 

FEET EAST OF THE CENTERLINE OF THE CSX TRANSPORTATION, INC. 

MAIN TRACK; THENCE NORTHEASTERLY AND PARALLEL TO SAID 

TRACK ALONG A CURVE TO THE LEFT (RADIUS=6301.73') THE CHORD 

WHICH BEARS N04°17'11"E, 164.85 FEET TO A 1/2" CAPPED REBAR SET (CA-

1037LS) AT THE END OF SAID CURVE; THENCE CONTINUE PARALLEL TO 

SAID TRACK N03°32'13"E,  A DISTANCE OF 577.15 FEET TO THE POINT OF 

BEGINNING.  THE ABOVE-DESCRIBED PROPERTY LIES IN THE SW 1/4 OF 

THE SW 1/4 OF SECTION 6 AND THE NW 1/4 OF THE NW 1/4 OF SECTION 7, 

ALL IN T16N, R18E, MONTGOMERY COUNTY, ALABAMA, AND 

CONTAINING 8.35 ACRES, MORE OR LESS, AND SUBJECT TO PUBLIC 

STREET RIGHT OF WAY (PRINCE STREET) OVER AND ACROSS SAID 

PROPERTY. 

 

 SECTION 2.  This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and 

publication, or as otherwise provided by law. 

 Mr. Tommy Tyson was present representing the Planning Commission.  No one was 

present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item. 

 

  Councillor Green made a motion to sustain the recommendation of the Planning 

Commission and adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 



The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed ordinance: 

 

ORDINANCE NO. _____________ 

 

  SECTION 1.  BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Appendix C – Zoning, Article VI, Sections 8.4, 8.5 and 

8.6 be amended to read as follows: 

8.4 Landscape Plan Submittal Requirements 

 

Format and Materials: 

The landscaping plan and details shall be drawn to the same standard scale as the 

development plan.  Landscape plans shall be included in the development plan 

submitted to the Urban Forester. 

 

General Information: 

Complete Landscape Plans submitted for review and approval shall include the 

following: 

(a) A title block, showing the title of the development, the name and address of 

the owner/developer, the name and address of the person or firm preparing 

the plan, the date of preparation, the scale, the north point, and the date of 

all revisions. 

(b) A location map, showing the relative location of the site to the nearest 

existing public street intersection. 

(c) The boundaries of the subject property including the location and 

description of all adjoining property, the location and names of all adjoining 

streets and easements. 

(d) The required number of parking spaces and the proposed number of 

parking spaces of subject property/development. 

(e) Location and dimensions of all entrances and exits of the parking lot and the 

manner in which vehicles will be parked, and the location and names of all 

utility lines, easements or right-of-ways on, or adjacent to, the site. 

(f) All details needed to communicate appearance, and methods of construction 

and/or installation.  International Society of Arboriculture tree installation 

details are required. 

(g) A planting schedule, keyed to the plant materials shown on the landscape 

plan, listing all proposed plant materials by botanical name, common name 

and cultivar, if any, quantity of materials, size of materials at planting, plant 

spacing, and existing trees approved for use. 

 

8.5 General Requirements 

 

Landscape improvements to parking lots shall be subject to the following requirements: 

 

 

 

8.5.1 Site protection and General Planting Requirements 

 

(a) Topsoil 

To the extent practicable, topsoil moved during the course of construction 

shall be preserved and stockpiled for re-use on the site. 

(b) Existing Trees 



Preservation of each existing healthy tree of an approved species, within 

required landscape areas, shall count toward fulfillment of these 

requirements. 

(1) The existing tree to be preserved must be approved by the Urban 

Forester to receive credit. 

(2) Existing trees that are credited towards meeting the requirements of 

this Section shall be subject to the same maintenance and replacement 

requirements as newly planted trees. 

(3) Each existing tree that is credited towards meeting the requirements of 

this Section shall reduce the number of required parking spaces by two 

(2). This subparagraph shall supercede and take precedence over 

Article III, Section 3(c) of the City’s Zoning Ordinance.  

(c) Slope Plantings 

Landscaping of all cuts and fills and/or terraces shall be matted or protected 

until plant cover is adequate to control erosion. 

(d) Size of Landscape Material 

Trees shall be a minimum of 2.5 in. in caliper and 12 ft. high.  Shrubbery 

shall have a minimum 18 inch height at installation (7 gallon container 

stock).   

(e) Quality of Landscape Material 

Landscape material shall conform to The American Standard for Nursery 

Stock (ANSI Z60.1). 

 

8.6 Landscaping Requirements 

 

8.6.1 Perimeter Planting Requirements for Parking Areas (Public R.O.W. 

excluded) 

 

(a) A continuous perimeter planting strip, exclusive of access driveways, with 

an average width of 8 ft. adjacent to public right-of-way and 4 ft. adjacent to 

property lines, measured from the edge of the parking area, is required.  

Existing street trees may be applied towards perimeter planting 

requirements along public right-of-way. 

(b) Canopy trees are required, and trees shall be planted on 40 to 50 ft. centers.  

In the event that pre-existing overhead utility lines prevent the use of canopy 

trees, understory trees shall be planted on 30 to 40 ft. centers.  Minimum 

lateral separation from overhead utilities shall be 20 ft. for canopy trees.  At 

least two (2) separate species must be used.  Monocultures are prohibited.  

Shrubbery capable of forming a minimum 3 foot high evergreen hedge shall 

be provided in the landscape areas adjacent to public right-of-way. 

(c) Planting strips are to be sodded, seeded, or mulched so as to leave no bare 

ground after landscape materials have been installed. 

(d) Existing trees which meet, in whole or in part, the perimeter and internal 

planting requirements, may be applied toward requirements.  During 

construction, trees or groups of trees that are being preserved must have a 

barrier constructed to the drip-line of the tree or group of trees, given the 

specific site considerations. 

(e) Trees which meet the perimeter planting requirements, whether existing or 

new, may be counted as one (1) parking space per tree and be used to fulfill 

the total parking requirement up to 25% of the parking required.  Use of 

trees to fulfill the parking requirements must be noted on the development 

plan.  This subparagraph shall supercede and take precedence over Article 

III, Section 3(c) of the City’s Zoning Ordinance. 

(f) Landscaping in and adjacent to parking lots shall not obstruct the driver’s 

view of the right-of-way at driveways and intersections, including that from 

adjoining properties. 



(g) In all districts, no fence, wall, shrubbery, sign, marquee or other obstruction 

to vision between the heights of 3½ ft. and 15 ft. above street level shall be 

permitted within 20 ft. of the intersection of the right-of-way lines of two 

streets, or railroads, or of a street and a railroad right-of-way, subject to the 

requirements of the Traffic Engineer. 

(h) In the event that non-residential development borders residential areas, a 10 

ft. wide landscape buffer shall be required along the common property 

boundary.  Canopy trees are required in the landscape buffer, and shall be 

planted on 20 ft. centers in order to form a screen at maturity.  All other 

aspects of the landscape buffer shall conform to the requirements of this 

ordinance.  Residential boundaries MUST be noted on the development plan.  

Previously platted lots at the adoption of this ordinance may be exempt from 

8.6.1 (h) if this requirement adversely affects minimum parking 

requirements. 

(i) An irrigation system shall be required in all landscape areas. 

 

8.6.2 Internal Planting Requirements for Parking Areas 

 

(a) Based on parking area size and layout, trees shall be planted within the 

paved parking area so that each parking space is within 60 ft. or less of a 

tree.  Perimeter trees and street trees as outlined above may be used to satisfy 

this requirement. 

(b) There shall be no more than 12 contiguous parking spaces without a 

landscape island.  Trees and shrubbery are required in the landscape island.  

A landscape island used to satisfy this requirement shall contain a minimum 

of 250 sq. ft. of area per tree with a minimum width of 8 ft.  Tree size and 

spacing are the same as for the perimeter planting requirements.  Shrubbery 

shall be provided in the island at the minimum rate of 2 plants per tree. 

(c) Landscape islands, based on the above requirements, shall be sodded, seeded 

or mulched.  

(d) Interior landscape islands may be counted as two (2) parking spaces per 

island and be used to fulfill the total parking requirement of the 

development.  Use of landscape islands to fulfill parking requirements must 

be noted on the development plan.  This subparagraph shall supercede and 

take precedence over Article III, Section 3 (c) of the City’s Zoning 

Ordinance.  

(e) An irrigation system shall be required in all landscape areas. 

(f)   Bio-retention as part of the landscape is encouraged and may be used to meet 

these requirements. 

(g) Internal landscape islands are not required in display areas for the purpose 

of automobile. 

 

SECTION 2.  BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that Section 8.9 be and is hereby repealed 

in its entirety. 

 

 SECTION 3.  This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and 

publication, or as otherwise provided by law. 

 Mr. Tommy Tyson was present representing the Planning Commission.  No one was 

present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item. 

 

 Councillor Bollinger requested this item be carried over to the next regular council 

meeting, which was the consensus of the Council. 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed ordinance: 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 27-2017 



  

 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, 

ALABAMA, that Appendix C – Zoning (Article VI) Section 10.14.2, Article 5, Section 5.6.8 

be amended to read as follows: 

 

5.6.8 (T5) Signage Standards 

a. Allowed signage may be externally lit, may contain neon, and signage within the 

shopfront glazing may be neon lit.  

b. Band Sign:  A single external band sign may be applied to the façade of each building, 

providing that such sign not exceed 3 ft. in height by any length.  For buildings of 10 

stories or more, a band sign at 10 stories or higher may be 9 ft. in height by any length. 

c. Blade Sign: 

1. Single-Tenant Building – One blade sign allowed for each façade along a public 

frontage, not to exceed 28 sq. ft., to be applied either to the façade above the 

entrance to the business, or anywhere on the façade along the public frontage, 

or to either side of the business entrance adjacent to the door, with a minimum 

8 ft. of clearance between bottom of sign and walkway. 

2. Multi-Tenant Building – In buildings with multiple tenants that do not have 

direct frontage to the public right-of-way or public alley, either/or shall apply: 

i. One blade sign for each business may be applied to the façade directly 

above the main entrance of the building, in which case multiple blade 

signs shall be stacked one above the other, not to exceed 15 sq. ft. per 

sign, or 

ii. One blade sign identifying the building may be applied at any location 

on the façade; and may have one Outdoor Display Case, not to exceed 

6 sq. ft., applied to the façade of the building adjacent to the main 

entrance. 

d. Awning Sign:  Awnings are permitted across the entire length of the façade of the 

building, or one awning per window and door, and may contain business 

identification and and/or business logo on the canopy, and may contain lettering or 

numbers on the valance.  

 This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and publication, or as 

otherwise provided by law. 

 Mr. Tommy Tyson was present representing the Planning Commission.  No one was 

present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition to this item. 

 

 Councillor Bollinger made a motion to sustain the recommendation of the Planning 

Commission and adopt the foregoing ordinance, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --7 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   LEE         --1 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 46-2017  

  

[GERHARDI] 

 

 WHEREAS, each of the City of Montgomery (“City”) and Montgomery County, 

Alabama (“County”) have been approached by Gerhardi, Inc., (herein referred to as 

“Gerhardi”) a foreign company whose identity is known to the City and County desiring to 

acquire, construct and equip a facility within the corporate limits of the City in the County, 

such project having a North American Industry Classification System code of 326199; and 

 



 WHEREAS, Gerhardi is expected to consist of approximately $33,770,000 in capital 

expenditures relating to the acquisition, construction and equipping of the facility and to 

create an additional 245 full-time jobs within 4 years of commencement of operations; and 

 

 WHEREAS, in connection with Gerhardi, the foreign company has requested that 

each of the City and the County grant abatements for non-educational ad valorem taxes for 

the maximum exemption period, construction related transaction taxes and mortgage and 

recording taxes permitted under the Tax Incentives Reform Act of 1992 (Ala. Code §40-9B-

1 et. seq.), as amended (“Act”); and  

 

WHEREAS, pursuant to §40-9B-5(b) of the Act and subject to the Montgomery 

County Commission also granting its approval for the requested abatements from the 

County for Gerhardi, the City is willing to permit and authorize The Industrial Development 

Board of the City of Montgomery (herein the “IDB”) to act, for and on behalf of the City, to 

negotiate, approve and grant the permissible abatements under the Act for the City’s portion 

of non-educational ad valorem taxes for the maximum exemption period under the Act, the 

construction related transaction taxes (other than those local construction related taxes 

levied for educational purposes or for capital improvements for education; the construction 

related transaction taxes, excluding local construction related transactional taxes levied for 

educational purposes or for capital improvements, are herein referred to as “Transaction 

Taxes”), and mortgage and recording taxes for Gerhardi.   

 

 NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the City Council of the City that, 

subject to the Montgomery County Commission also granting the requested abatements of 

the County’s portion of the non-educational ad valorem taxes for the maximum exemption 

period under the Act, the Transaction Taxes and mortgage and recording taxes for Gerhardi, 

the City, pursuant to §40-9B-5(b)(2) of the Act, does hereby authorize the IDB, as a public 

industrial authority (as defined in §40-9B-3(21) of the Act), to negotiate, authorize and grant, 

for and on behalf of the City, abatements of the City’s portion of non-educational ad valorem 

taxes for the maximum exemption period under the Act, the Transaction Taxes and 

mortgage and recording taxes as permitted under the Act for Gerhardi and to provide the 

City’s consent on its behalf; and 

 

 BE IT RESOLVED, FURTHER, that such authorization and permission is granted 

solely for Gerhardi hereunder and does not constitute a grant of permission and 

authorization to the IDB for any other project, which authority (if given) must be specifically 

granted to the IDB by the City through an adopted resolution for other projects; and 

 

 RESOLVED, FURTHER, that such authority to grant the abatements by the IDB 

shall require the IDB to grant such abatement pursuant to a resolution duly adopted by its 

Board of Directors, a certified copy of which shall be provided to the City at the same time 

it is provided to the Montgomery County Commission pursuant to §40-9B-5(d) of the Act. 

 

Councillor Bollinger made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Green made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 



 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 47-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Lyft, Inc., San Francisco, CA, has made application for a permit to 

operate a Transportation Network Company in the City of Montgomery; and 

 

WHEREAS, rules and regulations set out in Ordinance No. 1-2016, have been 

complied with: 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, Lyft, Inc., San Francisco, CA, be and is hereby granted 

approval to operate a Transportation Network Company in the City of Montgomery. 

 

Councillor Larkin made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Larkin made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider all objections and 

protests to the following proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 48-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Downtown Brew LLC, d/b/a Autism Crawfish Boil, 12 West Jefferson 

Davis Avenue, has filed an application for a Special Events Retail Liquor License, as 

indicated on the application form of the State of Alabama Alcoholic Beverage Control Board: 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, Downtown Brew LLC, d/b/a Autism Crawfish Boil, 12 West 

Jefferson Davis Avenue, be and is hereby approved for a Special Events Retail Liquor 

License, and concurrence in the issuance of the license by the State of Alabama Alcoholic 

Beverage Control Board.  

 

Mr. Bob Parker was present representing this item.  No one was present in opposition 

of this item. 

 

Councillor Green made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 



 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Green made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

     RESOLUTION NO. 49-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Emily Walker’s term on the Montgomery Clean City Commission 

expired December 31, 2016; and  

 

 WHEREAS, Councillor Larkin has nominated Beverly Lynn to serve on said board: 

   

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Beverly Lynn be and is hereby appointed to the 

Montgomery Clean City Commission for a three-year term, with term ending December 31, 

2019.    

 

Councillor Larkin made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Larkin made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 50-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Pamela Riley’s term on the Montgomery Clean City Commission 

expired November 18, 2016; and  

 

 WHEREAS, Councillor Larkin has nominated Stacy Tranthem to serve on said 

board: 

   

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Stacy Tranthem be and is hereby appointed to the 

Montgomery Clean City Commission for a three-year term, with term ending November 18, 

2019.    

 



Councillor Larkin made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Larkin made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 51-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Christopher Allen Wingard has resigned from the Board of Trustees – 

Retirement Fund whose term expired December 31, 2015; and  

 

 WHEREAS, Councillor Bell has nominated Ernest N. Finley, Jr. to serve on said 

board: 

   

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Ernest N. Finley, Jr. be and is hereby appointed to the 

Board of Trustees – Retirement Fund for an unexpired term ending December 31, 2019.    

 

Councillor Larkin made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Bell made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed authorization of demolition of an unsafe structure at 1520 French Street. 

  

 Mr. Herman Thorington was present representing this item. 

 

 Councillor Lee requested this item be carried over until the next regular council 

meeting, which was the consensus of the Council. 

 



The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed authorization of demolition of an unsafe structure at 2342 East Fourth Street. 

 

 Councillor Lee made a motion to authorize the demolition of an unsafe structure at 

2342 East Fourth Street, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed authorization of demolition of an unsafe structure at 513 Herron Street. 

 

 Councillor Lee made a motion to authorize the demolition of an unsafe structure at 

513 Herron Street, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed authorization of demolition of an unsafe structure at 3996 Macedonia Drive. 

 

 Councillor Lee made a motion to authorize the demolition of an unsafe structure at 

3996 Macedonia Drive, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed authorization of demolition of an unsafe structure at 1669 Opp Street. 

 

 Councillor Burkette made a motion to authorize the demolition of an unsafe structure 

at 1669 Opp Street, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 52-2017 

 

 WHEREAS, the Council of the City of Montgomery, Alabama ordered that the listed 

parcels of property in Exhibit “A” attached hereto be abated of the public nuisances 

described therein; and 

 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 11-53B-1, et. seq. Code of Alabama, 1975, the 

Housing Code Division of the City of Montgomery is presenting to the City Council the cost 

of abating said unsafe structures in Exhibit “A” attached hereto: 

 



 NOW. THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that the amount set opposite each described parcel of land 

contained in Exhibit “A” attached hereto shall constitute special assessments against such 

parcels of land and these assessments are hereby confirmed and shall constitute a lien on and 

against each respective parcel of land for the cost of removing the described unsafe structure.  

It is directed that a copy of the resolution be delivered to the Revenue Commissioner’s 

Records, County of Montgomery.  Said lien shall be superior to all other liens on said 

property except liens for taxes, and shall continue in force until paid. 

 
 

 

Councillor Larkin made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Lee made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 



 

 The Clerk stated this was the time and place to hear and consider the following 

proposed resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO.  53-2017 

 

WHEREAS, it has been determined that an accumulation of Dangerous Nuisances 

exist on the properties described in Exhibit “A” attached hereto; and 

 

WHEREAS, the owners of the described parcels of property have been identified 

utilizing the Revenue Commissioner’s Records in the Montgomery County Court House as 

those persons listed in Exhibit “A” attached hereto; and 

 

WHEREAS, the described parcels of property are all within the corporate limits of 

the City of Montgomery. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 12 of the Code 

of Ordinances of the City of Montgomery, the nuisances on the properties described in 

Exhibit “A” are declared to be public nuisances, ordered to be immediately abated, and 

authorizing the assessment of the cost of the abatement of the nuisances. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Councillor Larkin made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Lee made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 



NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 Councillor Green introduced the following resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 54-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Malcolm Calhoun’s term on the Planning Commission expired 

December 31, 2016; and  

 

 WHEREAS, Councillor Green has nominated Jerome T. Moore III to serve on said 

board: 

   

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Jerome T.  Moore III be and is hereby appointed to the 

Planning Commission for a three-year term, with term ending December 31, 2019.    

 

Councillor Green made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Green made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

Councillor Bell introduced the following resolution: 

 

RESOLUTION NO. 55-2017 

 

WHEREAS, Evelyn L. Wilson has resigned from the Community Action Committee 

with an unexpired term ending September 30, 2019; and  

 

 WHEREAS, Councillor Bell has nominated Bronett Terrell to serve on said board: 

   

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

MONTGOMERY, ALABAMA, that Bronett Terrell be and is hereby appointed to the 

Community Action Committee for an unexpired term ending September 30, 2019.    

 

Councillor Bell made a motion to suspend the rules in order that the foregoing 

resolution could be placed upon its final passage, which motion carried with the following 

vote: 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

 The rules having been suspended, Councillor Bell made a motion to adopt the 

foregoing resolution, which motion carried with the following vote: 



 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 

           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated she was in receipt of the following requests for authorization of 

payment from the Council Contingency Account, which were approved by Mayor Strange 

contingent upon receiving the required paperwork: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY 

 

 

 





 
 

Councillor Bollinger requested to add $1,000.00 to Lagoon Park Trails, Inc.; 

$1,000.00 to AUM Dixie Youth Baseball; and $1,000.00 to East Montgomery Baseball 

Association. 

 

Councillor Green requested to add $500.00 to YMCA Achievers Program and 

$500.00 to Nat King Cole Society, Inc. 

 

Councillor Jinright requested to add $500.00 to Nat King Cole Society, Inc. 

 

Councillor Lee requested to add $500.00 to YMCA Achievers Program; $500.00 to 

Nat King Cole Society, Inc.; $500.00 to Royal Ambassadors MED, Inc.; and $500.00 to PDI 

Based Initiative Veterans RePair, Inc. 

 

Councillor Jinright requested to add $500.00 to Royal Ambassadors MED, Inc.; and 

$500.00 to PDF Based Initiative Veterans RePair, Inc. 

 

Councillor Pruitt requested to add $500.00 to Georgetown Neighborhood Association. 

 

Councillor Larkin requested to add $500.00 to And Justice For All; $500.00 to YMCA 

Achievers Program; and $500.00 to Nat King Cole Society, Inc.  

 

Mayor Strange approved these additions contingent upon receiving the required 

paperwork. 

 

 Councillor Larkin made a motion to authorize the payment of allocations from the 

Council Contingency Account, with additions, contingent upon receiving the required 

paperwork, which motion carried with the following vote: 

 

 

 

 

AYES:           BOLLINGER, LYONS, LARKIN, GREEN, 



           BELL, LEE, PRUITT, JINRIGHT  --8 

NAYS:    NONE         --0 

ABSTAINED:   NONE         --0 

ABSENT:    BURKETTE        --1 

 

The Clerk stated the following Legal Notice would be advertised in the Montgomery 

Independent on March 9 & 16, 2017, for public hearing before the Council on April 4, 2017: 

 

LEGAL NOTICE 

 

Notice is hereby given that the Council of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, will meet at the 

Council Chamber, the regular meeting place of said Council, on Tuesday, April 4th, 2017 , at 

5:00 p.m., for the purpose of considering the adoption of the ordinance hereinafter set forth 

amending the Zoning Ordinance of the City of Montgomery, Alabama, adopted September 

17, 1963, and notice is hereby given that at such time and place all persons who desire shall 

have an opportunity of being heard in opposition to or in favor of the adoption of such 

ordinance. 

 

BRENDA GALE BLALOCK 

       CITY CLERK 

 

ORDINANCE NO. _____________ 

  

 

 BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY, 

ALABAMA as follows: 

 

 SECTION 1.  That the Zoning Ordinance of Montgomery, Alabama, adopted 

September 17, 1963, be amended by removing the following described property from an R-

60-s (Single-Family Residential) Zoning District to a B-2 (Commercial) Zoning District. 

 

Lot 6, Block 1 of Smiths Sub Brown Addition as recorded in the Office of the 

Judge of Probate of Montgomery County, Alabama, in Plat Book 006 at Page 

41; and Lot 5, according to A. E. Smith’s Subdivision of Lot No. 1, of the 

Brown Addition, as recorded in the Office of the Judge of Probate of 

Montgomery County, Alabama, in Plat Book 6, at Page 31, also a strip of land 

described as follows:  Beginning at the southeast corner of said Lot 5, thence 

westerly along the south lot line of said Lot 5 a distance of 50 ft. to the 

southwest corner of said Lot 5, thence southerly along the projection of the 

west lot line of Lot 5 a distance of 10 ft., thence east a distance of 50 ft. to a 

point on the projection of the east lot line of said Lot 5, thence north a distance 

of 10 ft. to the point of beginning.   

 

 SECTION 2.  This ordinance shall take effect upon its passage, approval and 

publication, or as otherwise provided by law. 

 

 Councillor Lee left the Council Chamber at 6:38 p.m. 

 

There being no further business to come before the Council, the meeting duly 

adjourned at 6:41 p.m. 

  

            _______________________________________ 

                   BRENDA GALE BLALOCK, CITY CLERK 

 

 

____________________________________ 

CHARLES W. JINRIGHT, PRESIDENT 

COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTGOMERY 

 


